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DATE, TIME, PLACE OF MEETING                   

 
The Calcasieu Parish School Board met in the Board Room of the Calcasieu Parish 

School Board, located at 3310 Broad Street, Lake Charles, Louisiana, 70615, on 

Tuesday, May 6, 2014, at 4:45 p.m. The meeting was called to order by Annette 

Ballard, President. The prayer was led by Clara Duhon; the Pledge of Allegiance was 

led by Jim Schooler.  

 

ROLL CALL 
  

The roll was called by Superintendent Savoy and the following members were present: 

Joe Andrepont, Annette Ballard, Billy Breaux, Randy Burleigh, Mack Dellafosse, 

Clara Duhon, Chad Guidry, Fred Hardy, Bill Jongbloed, Bryan LaRocque, Jim 

Schooler, Roman Thompson, and R. L. Webb. 

 

Absent: Dale Bernard, Jim Karr 

 

APPROVAL OF MINUTES 

 
Mr. Dellafosse made a motion to approve the Minutes of the CPSB meeting of April 8, 

2014 and with a second by Mr. Hardy, the motion carried.   

 

Mr. Andrepont made a motion to move items IX A&B to Items A&B under 

Presentations, with the other Presentation items to follow. Mrs. Duhon seconded the 

motion. On a vote, the motion carried.  

 

Mr. Burleigh made a motion to delete Items VIII A and IX C from the agenda. Mr. 

Andrepont seconded the motion. On a vote, the motion carried. Mr. Webb made a 

motion, with a second by Mr. Burleigh, to delete Item IX H, as it was a duplicate of 

deleted Item IX C. On a vote, the motion carried. 

 

PRESENTATIONS 

 
A. 2013-2014 Calcasieu Parish Students of the Year 

     Edwina Hall, Elementary Consultant, presented the following students: 

 

Elementary Division Winner 

Emma Kathryn Klenke 
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Vincent Settlement Elementary School 

 

Elementary Runner Up 

Sabrina Nicole Griffin 

Dolby Elementary School 

 

Middle School Division Winner 

Kaylee Charlene Cormier 

J.I. Watson Middle School 

 

Middle School Runner Up 

Mekenzie Marie Peshoff 

F.K. White Middle School 

 

High School Division Winner 

Alexandra Jacqueline Quigley DeFelice 

Sam Houston High School 

 

High School Runner Up 

Blane Elizabeth Edwards 

Barbe High School 

 

B. Varsity Quiz Bowl Top Scorers for Calcasieu Parish 

     Tonya LeBlanc, Parish Quiz Bowl Coordinator and Sheila Garner,  

      presented the following: 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

        

        C. Presentation to Children’s Miracle Network from Calcasieu Parish Wellness            

            Warriors 

    Skylar Giardina, Risk Manager, presented a check for $4,616.97 to Chuck                        

    O’Connor, Children’s Miracle Network Director, and Stephen Hotard, Chair of the          

    Christus St. Patrick Foundation. 

 

Student School 

Phillip Comeaux Sam Houston High School 

Britt Qualls Sulphur High School 

Maxwell Reeser Westlake High School 

Monica Nguyen Vinton High School 
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       D.  NAEA 2014 National Secondary Art Educator of the Year, Bobbi Yancey 

    Dr. Dan Vidrine, Art Supervisor K-12, introduced the Bobbi Yancy, the winner of           

    the National Secondary Art Educator of the Year award. 

 

SUPERINTENDENT’S REPORT 

 

Mr. Savoy gave the following report: 
Our Videographer: 

Kyle Breaux- Barbe 

  

1. All board members have received their school population reports, as of April 30, 

2014. 

2. All board members have received their  April, 2014  Headstart report: 

 Enrollment – 454 - Waiting List – 142  

 Disabilities – 35 and 36 evaluations in progress 

 Jake Drost: 

Employees of Lyondel Bissell and Knights of Columbus prepared grounds for  

garden area in the Learning Park.   

Donuts for Dads activity was held on April 2
nd

, the speaker was Keith Bell, Director 

of the Fatherhood Initiative of United Christian Fellowship Church in Lake Charles. 

 J. I. Watson Head Start held an Easter Activity for children and families. 

 End of the Year programs are being planned by all sites. 

 Screening for new children for 2014 - 2015 will be held May 13 – 23, 2014. 

3. Continuing with our renewed efforts to keep the Board informed on financial 

matters, I would like to report our current sales tax numbers for our general fund 

show April, 2014 collections at $829,470 over budget for the month. For the 2013-

2014  year, collections are $2,460,897 over budget. Collections for the first ten 

months of the year are $2,081,218 over the same ten months last year. 

4. Reminder to all board members that the Tier 2 Personal Financial Disclosure 

Statement is due May 15
th

. 

5. This first week of May is recognized as School Nutrition Employee Week and 

Teacher Appreciation Week…………. 

6. Gabe Broussard, a sixth grader at S.J. Welsh Middle School, was selected as a 

winner for his submission to Scholastic Action’s “Read, Write, Win!” national 

writing contest with the topic “A Pill for Passwords.”  He received an Amazon gift 

card from Scholastic to celebrate his win. Gabe is here tonight along with his family 

and his teacher, Ms. Jody Newton, who urged Gabe to participate in the national 

contest. We would like to congratulate Gabe on his win and encourage him to 

continue to sharpen his writing skills. 
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7. I want to recognize Paula Johnson, a member of our Pupil Appraisal Assessment 

Team for being named the State School Social Worker of the Year at the NASW 

state conference in March. 

 

Ms. Johnson demonstrates outstanding leadership throughout her employment as a 

school social worker.  She works closely with an Educational Diagnostician, School 

Psychologist and an Audiologist in following up on referrals from parents and/or 

school personnel of students in the school system, presenting some type of learning, 

physical or medical difficulty interfering with the student academic progress.  She 

works cooperatively with her appraisal team and the faculty of schools assigned as 

well as the parents who are not always sharing the same perception of their child as 

the system might.  Paula also serves on the Interagency Services Coordinating 

Committee assisting students and families in need of services inside and outside the 

parameter of the public school system.  She participates in Career Day at various 

schools presenting visual and auditory aids on the profession of social work. She was 

instrumental in having a policy passed for all the volunteer coaches and officials that 

requires a background check before working with youth in the area.  We are very 

proud to have her work with us here in our Calcasieu Parish School System. 

8. Wendy Gillet, a junior at Starks High School, was recently named to the 2014 

Under Armour/Softball Factory Pre-Season High School All-American Softball 

Team.”  She is one of forty girls chosen for the team out of more than 10,000 girls 

who were evaluated at previous Under Armour/Softball Factory events. 

  
COMMITTEE REPORT 
Superintendent Search Committee, March 25, 2014 

R.L. Webb, Chair 

 

Mr. Webb gave the following report: 
The Superintendent Search Committee of the Calcasieu Parish School Board met in the 

Board Room located at 3310 Broad Street, Lake Charles, Louisiana, 70615, on 

Thursday, May 1, 2014, at 4:45 p.m. The meeting was called to order by R.L. Webb, 

Chair. The prayer was led by Bryan LaRocque and the pledge was led by Joe 

Andrepont.  

 

Mr. Belfour called the roll and the following committee members were present: Mr. 

Webb, Mr. Andrepont, Mr. Burleigh, Mr. Dellafosse, Mrs. Duhon, Mr. Guidry, and Mr. 

Jongbloed. 

 

Other board members present: Mr. Hardy, Mrs. Ballard, Mr. Schooler, Mr. Karr, Mr. 

Breaux, and Mr. LaRocque. Mr. Thompson arrived after the roll was called. 
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TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION 

 

A. Discuss and Approve Interview Protocol 

 

 l. Number of candidates to be interviewed 

 

Mr. Dellafosse made a motion to interview all twelve of the applicants. Mr. Hardy 

seconded the motion. Mr. Andrepont offered an amendment to the motion, that all 

twelve would be interviewed, pending the investigation into whether they have met all 

requirements. Mrs. Duhon seconded that motion. On a vote, the amended motion did not 

carry. 

 

Mr. Schooler offered an amendment to interview all out of town applicants by tele-

conference, unless they choose to come on their own to interview in person. Mrs. 

Ballard seconded the motion. The amendment carried, with one nay vote. 

 

On behalf of the committee, Mr. Webb made a motion to 

accept.  A second was not needed and on a vote, the 

motion carried. 
 

Mr. Dellafosse, with a second by Mr. Schooler, offered an amendment to state that all 

interviewed applicants can come at their own expense for the first round or they can 

tele-conference for the first round. We would cover expenses only if they are invited 

back for a second interview. Reimbursement would be based on CPSB Travel Policy. 

On a vote for the amendment, it carried.  

 

On behalf of the committee, Mr. Webb made a motion to 

accept.  A second was not needed and on a vote, the 

motion carried. 
 

The vote for the original motion to interview all twelve candidates, amended to include 

travel options for first round attendance or tele-conferencing, carried. 

 

On behalf of the committee, Mr. Webb made a motion to 

accept.  A second was not needed and on a vote, the 

motion carried. Mr. Webb mentioned that there were no 

longer twelve applicants, since one had withdrawn. 
 

2. Length of interviews 
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Mrs. Ballard made a motion to limit the interviews to thirty minutes for the first round. 

There was no second. 

 

Mr. Andrepont made a motion to limit the interviews to a total of seventy five minutes 

for the first round. Mrs. Duhon seconded the motion. 

 

Mr. Hardy, with a second by Mr. Schooler, amended that motion to say seventy five 

minutes over a period of three days; they withdrew this amended motion. 

 

There was discussion regarding interviews being held during full days, rather than 

beginning in the evening at 4:45 p.m. 

 

Mr. Breaux made a substitute motion to interview for a total of one hour and forty five 

minutes for the first round. Mr. Dellafosse seconded this motion. On a vote, the motion 

carried. 

 

On behalf of the committee, Mr. Webb made a motion to 

accept.  A second was not needed and on a vote, the 

motion carried. Dr. Sheryl Abshire explained the tele-

conferencing process. Mr. Andrepont asked that all 

interviewees and the tech department be on standby, in 

case some interviews do not last the full allotted time. 
 

3. Decide on second interview for final selection 

 

Mr. Breaux made a motion to pay expenses, based on the CPSB Travel Policy, for all 

invited second round interviewees. Mr. Andrepont seconded the motion; they withdrew 

their motion. 

 

Mr. Andrepont offered a motion that for the second interview process, the top four, 

through the process of the previously approved voting method, would be offered a 

second interview. Mr. Karr seconded the motion. On a vote, the motion carried. 

 

On behalf of the committee, Mr. Webb made a motion to 

accept.  A second was not needed and on a vote, the 

motion carried.  
 

B. Discuss and Take Appropriate Action on Remaining Issues Regarding Selection 

of Superintendent 

 

The board members had previously been asked to submit five questions to PIO Kirby 
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Smith, to send to the applicants. The questions were consolidated and will be discussed 

at the next board meeting. 

 

C. Public input as to questions and desires for the candidates                                     

                                                                 

Blue cards: Joe Feucht, to discuss preferred qualifications 

                   Teri Johnson, representing CFT, to discuss recent teacher survey 

 

Mr. Hardy asked that Mrs. Ballard determine whether 

it would be appropriate to put all of the resumes of the 

applicants on the CPSB website. Mr. Webb thanked the 

committee, the board, Mr. Belfour and several others for 

the hard work involved in this process and dissolved the 

Search Committee, as all action now would be at full 

board meetings. 
 

On a motion to adjourn by Mr. Andrepont and a second by Mr. Hardy, the meeting was 

adjourned at 5:47 p.m. 

 

TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION 
(Items A&B were moved as Items A&B under Presentations) 

 

Mrs. Ballard read the following items: 
 

A. Approval of Proces Verbal and Resolution promulgating the results of a Special       

Election held on May 3, 2014 

 
   Lake Charles, Louisiana 

   May 6, 2014 

 

 The Parish School Board of Calcasieu Parish, Louisiana, met in regular session at 4:45 o’clock p.m. on 

Tuesday, May 6, 2014, at the regular meeting place of said Board in the Calcasieu Parish School Board Office, 3310 

Broad Street, Lake Charles, Louisiana, pursuant to the provisions of written notice given to each and every member 

thereof and duly posted in the manner required by law. 

 President, Annette Ballard, called the meeting to order and on roll call, the following members were 

present: 

Joe A. Andrepont, Annette Ballard, Billy Breaux, Randall Burleigh, Mack Dellafosse, Clara Duhon, Chad Guidry,  

Fredman Hardy, Jr., Bill Jongbloed, Bryan LaRocque, Jim Schooler, Roman Thompson and R. L. Webb 

 

ABSENT: Dale Bernard and James W. Karr, Sr. 
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 Wayne R. Savoy, Board Secretary, also attended.  The meeting was called to order and the roll called 

with the above results. 

 

 The President of the Board stated that one purpose of the meeting was for canvassing and tabulating the 

returns of an election held in Calcasieu Parish, Louisiana on May 3, 2014, on the question of renewal of a special ad 

valorem tax of 3.50 mills for a period of ten (10) years beginning January 1, 2015, upon all taxable property within 

the Parish for the purpose of providing additional support for maintenance and operation of the public schools of 

Calcasieu Parish, and a proposition authorizing renewal of a ½% sales and use tax with proceeds of the tax dedicated 

exclusively for supplementing the salaries of teachers and other employees of the Calcasieu Parish School Board, and 

thereupon presented the following proces verbal, which was adopted by the following vote: 

 

YEAS: Mr. Andrepont, Mr. Breaux, Mr. Burleigh, Mr. Dellafosse, Mrs. Duhon, Mr. Guidry, Mr. Hardy, Mr. 

Jongbloed, Mr. LaRocque, Mr. Schooler, Mr. Thompson and Mr. Webb 

 

NAYS: None 

 

NOT VOTING: President Ballard 

 

PROCES VERBAL 

 

 BE IT KNOWN AND REMEMBERED that on this 6th day of May, 2014, at 4:45 o’clock p.m., in 

accordance with a resolution of the Calcasieu Parish School Board (the “Board”), adopted on January 14, 2014, and 

recorded in the records of said Board, notice of which meeting was issued and published according to law, the 

undersigned members of the Board, being a quorum thereof, met at the regular meeting place of the Board, and 

according to law examined the tabulation blanks, certificates and statements which were received from the 

Commissioners and Commissioners-in-Charge of the election held in Calcasieu Parish, Louisiana on May 3, 2014, in 

accordance with said resolution, together with the transcription of the totals made by the Clerk of Court and Ex-

Officio Parish Custodian of Voting Machines in and for Calcasieu Parish to determine the following propositions: 

 

MAINTENANCE MILLAGE RENEWAL PROPOSITION 

 

Shall the Parish School Board of the Parish of Calcasieu, State of Louisiana, under the 

provisions of Article 8, Section 13(C)(Third) of the Constitution of 1974 of the State of 

Louisiana, La. R.S. 39:701, et seq., and other constitutional and statutory authority 

supplemental thereto, continue to levy and collect each year for a period of ten years 

beginning January 1, 2015, a special tax of 3.50 mills on the dollar of all property subject to 

taxation in the Parish of Calcasieu, Louisiana, with collections from the levy of the tax 

estimated to be $5,916,000 for one entire year for the purpose of providing additional 

support for maintenance and operation of the public schools of Calcasieu Parish? 

 

SALES TAX RENEWAL PROPOSITION 

 

Shall the Calcasieu Parish School Board, Calcasieu Parish, Louisiana, under the provisions 

of Article 6, Section 29 of the Constitution of 1974 of the State of Louisiana, La. R.S. 
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47:338.54, and other constitutional and statutory authority supplemental thereto, extend for a 

period of ten years beginning October 1, 2015, and be authorized to continue to levy and 

collect, and adopt an ordinance providing for such levy and collection, a tax of one-half of 

one percent (½ of 1%), with collections from the tax estimated to be $22,570,000 for one 

entire year, currently being collected  upon the sale at retail, the use, the lease or rental, the 

consumption and storage for use or consumption of tangible personal property and on sales 

of services in Calcasieu Parish, Louisiana, all presently or hereafter defined in La. R.S. 

47:301 through La. R.S. 47:317, with the proceeds of the tax to be dedicated exclusively for 

supplementing the salaries of teachers and other employees of the Calcasieu Parish School 

Board? 

 

 The results of said election on the Maintenance Millage Renewal Proposition proved to be 

                                as  follows: 

 

   NUMBER OF VOTES IN NUMBER OF VOTES 

 PRECINCT FAVOR OF PROPOSITION AGAINST PROPOSITION 

  160E  34  16 

  160W  13  11 

  161  32  16 

  162E  71  19 

  162W  57  13 

163  68  17 

  164  17  6 

  165  67  14 

  166  99  22 

  167  63  14 

  260  70  19 

  261  53  5 

262  68  9 

300  31  27 

  301  63  24 

  302  15  10 

  303E  25  17 

  303W  9  6 

  304  44  16 

  305  32  18 

  306  89  28 

  307  15  5 

  308  35  13 

  309E  7  1 

  309W  50  10 

  310  41  11 

  311  18  8 

  312  62  19 

  313E  0  0 

  313W  20  21 

  314  72  18 

  315E  29  12 

  315W  56  6 

  316E  26  2 

  316W  13  1 

  317  38  5 

  318  26  17 

  319N  8  4 
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  319S  7  9 

  320E  23  8 

  320W  35  13 

  321  46  15 

  322  55  4 

  323  42  15 

  324  51  11 

  325  98  34 

  326  94  15 

  327  21  12 

  328  86  7 

  329  54  12 

  330  28  6 

  331  66  15 

  332N  29  7 

  332S  27  7 

  333  164  41 

  334  75  32 

  335  62  16 

  336  986  25 

  337  75  24 

  338  110  19 

  339  147  39 

  360  18  12 

  361  29  6 

  362  79  28 

  363  116  38 

  364  62  17 

  365  76  22 

  366  34  20 

  367N  172  48 

  367S  49  15 

  368  99  45 

  369  71  31 

  370  69  34 

  371N  15  5 

  371S  63  19 

  400  134  83 

  401  113  67 

  402  122  57 

  403  235  83 

  404  357  108 

  405  334  171 

  406  162  82 

  407  211  75 

  408  212  93 

  440  68  13 

  441  50  13 

  460E  25  4 

  460W  39  16 

  461  46  14 

  462  4  2 

  463  89  12 

  464  65  21 
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  465  42  10 

  466E  42  19 

  466W  95  30 

  467  31  14 

  468  39  26 

  469  44  15 

  560  17  10 

  561  17  10 

  562  3  3 

  600  37  4 

  601  18  4 

  602  29  12 

  603  23  1 

  660  47  10 

  661  20  4 

  662  26  13 

  663  11  2 

  664  38  25 

  700  29  1 

  701  13  0 

  702  24  6 

  703  8  8 

  760  22  3 

  761  18  4 

  762  4  4 

  800  30  4 

  801  45  7 

  860N  53  18 

  860S  74  21 

  861E  27  6 

  861W  28  3 

 Absentees      1,187        517 

                TOTALS                                 8,386                                              2,934 

 

 We therefore ascertained that the majority of qualified electors of Calcasieu Parish, Louisiana qualified 

to vote under the Constitution and laws of the State of Louisiana voting in said election voted in favor of the 

maintenance millage renewal proposition. 

 

 At the same time and place, we did examine and canvass the returns as evidenced by said tabulation 

blanks, certificates, and statements received from the election Commissioners and Commissioners-in-Charge, the 

correctness of which were sworn to by the election Commissioners-in-Charge and Commissioners according to 

law, and our finding was that the returns indicated a majority voted in favor of said maintenance millage renewal 

proposition. 

 

 The results of said election on the Sales Tax Renewal Proposition proved to be as  follows: 

 

   NUMBER OF VOTES IN NUMBER OF VOTES 

 PRECINCT FAVOR OF PROPOSITION AGAINST PROPOSITION 

  160E  35  15 
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  160W  13  11 

  161  30  18 

  162E  72  19 

  162W  58  12 

163  67  18 

  164  18  5 

  165  65  15 

  166  104  19 

  167  64  13 

  260  74  15 

  261  55  3 

262  69  7 

300  35  23 

  301  61  25 

  302  17  9 

  303E  27  14 

  303W  9  5 

  304  49  13 

  305  38  12 

  306  92  25 

  307  18  2 

  308  36  11 

  309E  8  1 

  309W  48  10 

  310  41  11 

  311  17  9 

  312  64  17 

  313E  0  0 

  313W  20  21 

  314  66  22 

  315E  29  12 

  315W  55  6 

  316E  23  4 

  316W  13  1 

  317  40  4 

  318  25  17 

  319N  8  4 

  319S  8  8 

  320E  22  9 

  320W  36  12 

  321  48  13 

  322  55  4 

  323  44  16 

  324  50  12 

  325  98  35 

  326  91  17 

  327  22  11 

  328  85  10 

  329  52  13 

  330  30  5 

  331  69  13 

  332N  29  7 

  332S  27  6 

  333  166  39 
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  334  77  30 

  335  63  13 

  336  103  19 

  337  77  23 

  338  112  17 

  339  145  43 

  360  18  13 

  361  29  7 

  362  81  25 

  363  116  37 

  364  62  18 

  365  75  21 

  366  36  19 

  367N  175  47 

  367S  52  13 

  368  104  41 

  369  72  31 

  370  67  36 

  371N  15  5 

  371S  63  19 

  400  136  83 

  401  119  64 

  402  124  56 

  403  241  83 

  404  370  97 

  405  352  153 

  406  164  81 

  407  216  73 

  408  224  84 

  440  67  13 

  441  50  13 

  460E  24  5 

  460W  41  14 

  461  45  15 

  462  3  2 

  463  89  13 

  464  69  18 

  465  42  10 

  466E  40  21 

  466W  99  27 

  467  33  12 

  468  43  22 

  469  46  14 

  560  15  12 

  561  17  8 

  562  5  2 

  600  36  5 

  601  18  4 

  602  29  12 

  603  23  1 

  660  46  11 

  661  21  4 

  662  25  14 

  663  11  2 
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  664  40  24 

  700  29  2 

  701  13  0 

  702  26  6 

  703  8  8 

  760  23  2 

  761  17  5 

  762  4  4 

  800  31  3 

  801  47  5 

  860N  56  15 

  860S  80  15 

  861E  27  6 

  861W  28  3 

 Absentees      1,214         494 

                TOTALS  8,563  2,795 

 

 We therefore ascertained that the majority of qualified electors of Calcasieu Parish, Louisiana qualified 

to vote under the Constitution and laws of the State of Louisiana voting in said election voted in favor of the sales 

tax renewal proposition. 

 

 At the same time and place, we did examine and canvass the returns as evidenced by said tabulation 

blanks, certificates, and statements received from the election Commissioners and Commissioners-in-Charge, the 

correctness of which were sworn to by the election Commissioners-in-Charge and Commissioners according to 

law, and our finding was that the returns indicated a majority voted in favor of said sales tax renewal proposition. 

 

 Therefore, we declare that the result of said election is in favor of the Maintenance Millage Renewal 

Proposition and the Sales Tax Renewal Proposition as stated above. 

 

 In accordance with law, a resolution promulgating the aforesaid results was adopted, and the Secretary 

of the Board was ordered to have a copy of said resolution signed by the President and published in one issue of 

the Lake Charles American Press, a newspaper published in Calcasieu Parish and of general circulation in said 

Calcasieu Parish, Louisiana. 

 

 We did, likewise, order that one copy of this proces verbal be sent to the Secretary of State to be 

recorded in the archives of the State of Louisiana, and that one copy be sent to the Clerk of the District Court of 

Calcasieu Parish to be recorded in the mortgage records of said Parish and that one copy be filed in the archives 

of this Board. 

 THUS DONE AND SIGNED in the presence of    Sharon Allured                       and      Peggy Carlile      

                   , competent witnesses and qualified voters of Calcasieu Parish on this 6th day of May, 2014, at a 

regular meeting of the Calcasieu Parish School Board in Lake Charles, Louisiana, by the undersigned members of 

said Board present and participating in the canvass of said election. 
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WITNESSES: 

 

 /s/ Sharon Allured                                 /s/ Annette Ballard                            , President 

   Annette Ballard 

 

 /s/ Peggy Carlile                                    /s/ Jim Schooler                            , V. President 

   Jim Schooler 

 

    /s/ Randall Burleigh                        , Member 

   Randall Burleigh 

 

    /s/ Chad Guidry                              , Member 

   Chad Guidry 

 

    /s/ Clara F. Duhon                            , Member 

   Clara F. Duhon 

 

    /s/ Bryan LaRocque                            , Member 

   Bryan LaRocque 

 

    /s/ Fredman Hardy, Jr.                       , Member 

   Fredman Hardy, Jr. 

 

    /s/ R. L. Webb                                 , Member 

   R. L. Webb 

 

    /s/ Bill Jongbloed                               , Member 

   Bill Jongbloed 

 

                            , Member James W. Karr, Sr. 

 

    /s/ Joe Andrepont                               , Member 

   Joe Andrepont 

 

    /s/ Mack Dellafosse                        , Member 

   Mack Dellafosse 

 

                                                           , Member 

   Dale B. Bernard 

 

    /s/ Roman Thompson                        , Member 

   Roman Thompson 

 

    /s/ Billy Breaux                                  , Member 

   Billy Breaux 

 

 The following resolution was thereupon introduced, and pursuant to a motion made by Mr. Schooler and 

seconded by Mr. Burleigh, was adopted by the following vote: 

 

YEAS: Mr. Andrepont, Mr. Breaux, Mr. Burleigh, Mr. Dellafosse, Mrs. Duhon, Mr. 

Guidry, Mr. Hardy, Mr. Jongbloed, Mr. LaRocque, Mr. Schooler, Mr. Thompson and Mr. Webb 
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NAYS: None 

 

ABSENT: Mr. Bernard and Mr. Karr 

 

NOT VOTING:  President Ballard 

 

 

RESOLUTION 

 

A RESOLUTION PROMULGATING THE RESULTS OF A SPECIAL ELECTION HELD IN CALCASIEU 

PARISH, LOUISIANA ON MAY 3, 2014. 

 

 

 WHEREAS, on May 3, 2014, an election was held in Calcasieu Parish, Louisiana, to determine the 

propositions hereinafter set out; 

 

 WHEREAS, the returns of said election were canvassed by the Board according to law and notice duly 

given as provided by law, and the result of said election was declared to be in favor of said propositions; 

 

 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Parish School Board of Calcasieu Parish, Louisiana, as 

follows: 

 

 SECTION 1.  An election was held in Calcasieu Parish, Louisiana, on May 3, 2014, to determine the 

propositions hereinafter set out; that said election was duly and properly called by the Board by a resolution 

adopted on January 14, 2014, and recorded in the records of said Board, that notice of said election 

embracing all matters required by law to be contained therein was given by publication in the Lake Charles 

American Press, a newspaper published in Lake Charles, Louisiana, and of general circulation in Calcasieu 

Parish, Louisiana, on  February 17, February 24, March 3, and March 10, 2014; that this Board did in said 

resolution designate the polling places for said election and did provide for the use of voting machines in the 

conduct of said election; that election officials were duly selected; that each election official received the 

certificate of instruction of the use of the voting machines and his duties in connection therewith as required 

by law; that the State Custodian of Voting Machines and the Clerk of Court and Ex-Officio Parish Custodian 

of Voting Machines of Calcasieu Parish made available on the day of the election at the polling places 

designated for the conduct of said election the necessary voting machines and all necessary equipment and 

paraphernalia required by law in connection with the use of voting machines at elections; that the Registrar of 

Voters and the Clerk of Court of Calcasieu Parish furnished to the election Commissioners and 

Commissioners-in-Charge copies of the precinct registers for each precinct or ward entitled to vote at such 

polling places; that the Louisiana Secretary of State prepared and certified the ballot used in the voting 

machines as required by law; that the proposition voted on in said election and as it appeared in said voting 

machine was in due form provided by law and the resolution adopted by this Board on January 14, 2014, 
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calling said special election; that the results of said election were written on a large sheet of paper at said 

polling places, which sheet of paper was signed by each of the election officials designated to conduct such 

election at said polling places and which sheet was thereupon posted in public view at the polling places in 

accordance with law; that only qualified electors under the Constitution and laws of the State of Louisiana 

voted at said election; that the officials who served at said election were duly and properly appointed; that the 

places of all absent election officials were properly filled in accordance with law; that before opening the 

polls all election officials were properly sworn in accordance with law; that the polls at the voting places were 

opened at 7:00 a.m. and remained open and until not later than 8:00 p.m.; that after the closing of the polls 

the votes for and against the proposition were properly counted and tallied and the necessary tabulation 

blanks, certificates and statements were made by the election officials in accordance with law and the voting 

machines delivered to the Clerk of Court and Ex-Officio Custodian of Voting Machines in and for Calcasieu 

Parish, Louisiana, and a copy of the results of said election delivered to the Clerk of the District Court of 

Calcasieu Parish as required by Louisiana law; that on May 6, 2014, that being the third day after said 

election the Clerk of Court and Ex-Officio Custodian of Voting Machines, after breaking the seals and 

opening the voting machines used in said election did transcript the totals for the proposition voted upon at 

said election; and that all things whatsoever required by law to be done in connection with the holding of said 

election were properly and duly performed in manner and form as required by Part IV of Chapter 4 of Subtitle 

II of Title 39 of the Louisiana Revised Statutes of 1950, as amended (La. R.S. 39:701, et seq.), and the 

general election laws of the State of Louisiana. 

 

 SECTION 2.  In said election the following propositions were approved by a majority of the 

electors qualified to vote and voting in said election in Calcasieu Parish, Louisiana: 

 

MAINTENANCE MILLAGE RENEWAL PROPOSITION 

 

Shall the Parish School Board of the Parish of Calcasieu, State of Louisiana, under 

the provisions of Article 8, Section 13(C)(Third) of the Constitution of 1974 of the 

State of Louisiana, La. R.S. 39:701, et seq., and other constitutional and statutory 

authority supplemental thereto, continue to levy and collect each year for a period 

of ten years beginning January 1, 2015, a special tax of 3.50 mills on the dollar of 

all property subject to taxation in the Parish of Calcasieu, Louisiana, with 

collections from the levy of the tax estimated to be $5,916,000 for one entire year 

for the purpose of providing additional support for maintenance and operation of 

the public schools of Calcasieu Parish? 

 

SALES TAX RENEWAL PROPOSITION 

 

Shall the Calcasieu Parish School Board, Calcasieu Parish, Louisiana, under the 

provisions of Article 6, Section 29 of the Constitution of 1974 of the State of 

Louisiana, La. R.S. 47:338.54, and other constitutional and statutory authority 

supplemental thereto, extend for a period of ten years beginning October 1, 2015, 

and be authorized to continue to levy and collect, and adopt an ordinance 

providing for such levy and collection, a tax of one-half of one percent (½ of 1%), 
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with collections from the tax estimated to be $22,570,000 for one entire year, 

currently being collected  upon the sale at retail, the use, the lease or rental, the 

consumption and storage for use or consumption of tangible personal property and 

on sales of services in Calcasieu Parish, Louisiana, all presently or hereafter 

defined in La. R.S. 47:301 through La. R.S. 47:317, with the proceeds of the tax 

to be dedicated exclusively for supplementing the salaries of teachers and other 

employees of the Calcasieu Parish School Board? 

 

 

 SECTION 3.  The results of said election shall be promulgated by publication of this 

resolution of promulgation one time in the Lake Charles American Press, a newspaper published in 

Lake Charles, Louisiana, the official journal of the Board and of general circulation in Calcasieu 

Parish, Louisiana. 

 

 ADOPTED AND APPROVED this 6th day of May, 2014. 

 

    /s/ Annette Ballard                                      

    

   ANNETTE BALLARD, President 

   Calcasieu Parish School Board 

ATTEST: 

 

  /s/ Wayne R. Savoy                               

WAYNE R. SAVOY, Secretary 

Calcasieu Parish School Board 
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On a motion to approve by Mr. Schooler and a second by Mr. Burleigh, the 

motion carried.  

 

B. Receive and take appropriate action on survey results, as prepared by MSU and    

the Chamber Southwest (The survey is available for viewing at 3310 Broad Street    

and is posted at the end of this document in the official Minutes on file.) 

 

Dr. Dustin Hebert (MSU) presented a summary of the report to the board, prepared 

by Dr. Faye White (MSU) and Mr. Richard Smith (SWLA Economic Development 

Alliance). Mrs. Ballard, on behalf of the board, thanked them for their hard work. 

 

On a motion to accept by Mr. Andrepont and a second by Mr. Hardy, the motion 

carried. 

 

C. Take action regarding letter from Chennault International Airport Authority 

 

On a motion to approve by Mr. Andrepont and a second by Mrs. Duhon, the motion 

carried. 
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D. Approval of District Technology Plan 2014-2017 

 

On a motion to approve by Mr. Dellafosse and a second by Mr. Burleigh, the 

motion carried. 
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E. Approval of Calcasieu Child Care Resource and Referral Services Grant 

 
Grant Title:  Calcasieu Child Care Resource and Referral Services (CCCRR) 

 

Grant Source:  State 

 

Grant Amount:  $481,289.88 

 

Schools:  Calcasieu Parish 

 

Person Applying:  Sheryl Piper – Early Childhood Director 

 

Purpose:  To ensure that more children are ready for kindergarten a centralized location in 

Calcasieu Parish will be utilized to enhance high-quality teaching and early learning 

environment for children Birth to 5.  Louisiana has multiple Early Childhood programs 

serving birth to age five “at-risk” children that operate with public funds, including public 

school prekindergarten programs (LA 4, 8g, Title I, IDEA), the Nonpublic School Early 

Childhood Development (NSECD) program, Head Start, Early Head Start, Early Steps, and 

the Child Care Assistance Program (CCAP).  To ensure that more children are ready for 

kindergarten, the Early Childhood Care and Education Act of 2012 (Act 3) charged the State 

Board of Elementary and Secondary Education with unifying these program into a high-

quality system.  This grant will also provide additional support services through Early 

Childhood Development and Learning Coaches.  The strategies being used to satisfy this 

mandate are: 

1. Unify expectations for high quality teaching and early learning 

2. Support teachers and providers to reach expectations 

3. Measure and recognize progress 

4. Fund providers that serve children well 

5. Provide clear information and high quality choices to families 

 

On a motion to approve by Mr. Dellafosse and a second by Mrs. Duhon, the motion carried. 

 

F. Approval of CPSB/Early Childhood Department Resolution 

 
RESOLUTION 

 

 

BE IT RESOLVED on this May 6, 2014 that the Calcasieu Parish 

School Board (CPSB) and the Early Childhood Department will 

provide a high-quality teaching and learning environment of children 
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Birth to 5. 

 

FURTHERMORE CPSB/Early Childhood Department will provide 

a centralized location in Calcasieu Parish to ensure that more 

children are ready for kindergarten in Southwest Louisiana. 

 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that CPSB/Early Childhood 

Department will provide support through professional development, 

technical assistance, coaching, and resources in order to enhance the 

learning opportunities for staff and children. 

 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that CPSB/Early Childhood 

Department will continue to provide networking opportunities for 

prekindergarten programs (LA 4, 8g, Title I, IDEA), the Nonpublic 

School Early Childhood Development (NSECD ) program, Head 

Start, Early Steps, and the Child Care Assistance Program (CCAP). 

 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that CPSB/Early Childhood 

Department will strive to meet all focus goals set forth by the Early 

Childhood Care and Education Act of 2012 (Act 3). 

 

_________________________________________

 ________________ 

School Board President    Date 

 

 

_________________________________________

 _________________ 

School Board Secretary    Date 

 

On a motion to approve by Mr. Burleigh and a second by Mr. Dellafosse, the 

motion carried. 

        

 H.. Approval of 2013-2014 Pupil Progression Plan Addendum 

 

On a motion to approve by Mr. Burleigh and a second by Mr. Dellafosse, the 

motion carried. 
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BID REPORTS 

 

Mrs. Ballard read the following items: 

 
          A.Bid 2015-01 Janitorial Supplies/General Funds/CPSB Warehouse 
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          On a motion to approve by Mr. Webb and a second by Mr. Burleigh, the motion      

          carried. 

 

          B.Bid 2015-14 Pest Control/General Funds 

 

                          

                                   
On a motion to approve by Mr. Burleigh and a second by Mr. Dellafosse, the 

motion carried. 

 

  C.RFP 2015-15 Plumbing Contract Services/General Funds 
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On a motion to approve by Mr. Burleigh and a second by Mr. Dellafosse, the 

motion carried. 

 

Blue cards (in favor of the new rotation plan): Ricky Campbell, Jim Trouth, Adam 

Dautriel 

                   

 D. RFP 2015-27 Electrical Contract Services/General Funds   

 

                   
On a motion to approve by Mr. Burleigh and a second by Mr. Webb, the motion 

carried. 

 

          E. RFP 2015-28 General Contract Services/General Funds 
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On a motion to approve by Mr. Webb and a second by Mr. Dellafosse, the motion 

carried. 

            

          F. Iowa Middle School, District 25 Bond Funds; Bid #2014-06PC 

          G. Construction of Covered Walkway and Drop Off Area at Moss Bluff Middle      

                  School/Sales Tax District 
                       

    The Committee to receive bids met on the date herein indicated   

  and reviewed bids on the following project. 

  

    DATE: May 06,2014 

  

    
DESCRIPTION: 

Construction of Covered Walkway and Drop-Off Area at Moss Bluff 

Middle School  

 

    
FUNDS: SD # 25 Bond Funds 

    
BID NUMBER: 201-11PC 

    
DESIGNER: C.R. Fugatt, AIA 

                         CONTRACTOR   BASE BID 

Sam Istre Constuction   $215,500.00  

K & J Development of SWLA LLC   $186,700.00  

Shannon Smith Construction   $207,300.00  
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John D. Myers & Assoc., Inc.   $171,700.00  

Frey Construction & Dirt Services, LLC   $227,500.00  

      

  

  

 

    The Committee recommends award of the contract to: 

  

 

John D. Myers 

(Base Bid) in the amount of: 

  

One Hundred Seventy -One Thousand Seven Hundred Dollars and No/100 

as the lowest qualified bidder meeting specifications. 

   

On a motion to approve by Mr. LaRocque and a second by Mr. Hardy, the motion 

carried. 

 

          H. Phase I- Building Renovations Vinton Middle School/District 26 Vinton Bond   

                  Funds 

 

            The Committee to receive bids met on the date herein indicated and reviewed bids 

 on the following project. DATE: 9 April,14   

     
DESCRIPTION: 

Phase 1- Building Renovations Vinton Middle School  

 
FUNDS: SD # 26 Bond Funds 

BID NUMBER: 2014-09PC 

DESIGNER: Ellender Architects & Associates Inc. 

 

        

                     CONTRACTOR BASE BID ALT. # 1 ALT. # 2 

Bessette Development $1,220,000.00  $67,530.00    

Bryan Contracting Group No Bid     

John D Myers No Bid     

Gunter 

Construction   $1,546,675.00  $70,900.00    

Pat Williams Construction $1,283,000.00  $85,000.00    

Ragan builders 

 

$1,486,000.00  $86,450.00  

 
Shannon Smith Construction NO Bid 

  
W.B. Construction & Sons No Bid 
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     The Committee recommends award of the contract to: 

   

 

Bessette Development 

BASE BID AND ALTERNATE NO. 1 IN THE AMOUNT OF: 

  

One Million two hundred eighty -seven thousand five hundred thirty dollars and 00/100 

as the lowest qualified bidder meeting specifications. 

   

     DESCRIPTION OF ALTERNATES: 

   

 ALTERNATE #1:  Replace glass block at Administration / Classroom Wing 

 

 

  On a motion to approve by Mr. Guidry and a second by Mr. Webb, the motion 

carried. 

 

CORRESPONDENCE 

 

Mrs. Ballard read the following item: 

 
A. Change Order Number One (1), for the Project, “JI Watson New Middle 

School Site Preparation,” Project MA1310A; Moss Architects, Inc., Designer; 

McManus Construction, LLC, Contractor; Increase of thirty two (32) days. 

 

On a motion to approve by Mr. Webb and a second by Mr. Burleigh, the motion 

carried. 

 

CONDOLENCES/RECOGNITIONS 

 
Mr. Savoy thanked the employees for helping with the recent election and 

passage of the millage. 

 

Mr. Thompson recognized an audience member, Mary Morris, a member of 

the Lake Charles City Council.  

 

Mr. Jongbloed recognized the Barbe baseball team (boys) for being ranked the 

number one high school baseball team in the nation.  

 

Mr. Dellafosse thanked all teachers for everything they do for our children. 

 

Mr. Andrepont asked for a letter of commendation to Starks High School and 

DeQuincy High School regarding their participation in FastPitch 56. He asked 

for a letter to Sulphur Parks and Recreation regarding the phenomenal 

facilities and turnout for FastPitch 56. 
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Mr. Webb asked for a letter of condolence to Gary Fiske at the loss of his 

wife. 

 

Mr. Schooler recognized the Barbe Baseball team (boys) in the quarter finals 

and he encouraged all board members to go out and watch them play. 

 

Mrs. Ballard asked for a letter of condolence to the family of Mr. Meador and 

a letter of condolence to Esther Vincent at the loss of her mother. Mrs. Ballard 

thanked the principals and staff of all schools for all of their hard work and 

extra hours. 

 

Mr. Burleigh asked for a letter of condolence to the family of Peggy Blocker. 

He ask for a letter of recognition to both Beth Fraser at Barbe High School and 

Lee Crick at Westlake High School, regarding those schools being named to 

the top twenty public high schools in the Louisiana, in preparing them for 

higher education. 

 

COMMITTEE AGENDA ITEMS 

 
Mr. Andrepont requested a discussion on students with failing grades not being 

allowed to take job related field trips that could be of benefit to their future job 

opportunities. 

 

Mr. Breaux asked that principals could be reminded that work orders need to be 

turned in now, not in August when school starts. 

 

Mrs. Duhon asked that CWA clarify the new out of zone regulations, as she felt the 

newspaper ad wasn’t clear to the public. 

 

SCHEDULE COMMITTEES 

 
Special Called Board Meeting…………………..…4:30 p.m., May 13, 2014 

Budget Committee……………..………………..…4:45 p.m., May 27, 2014 

 

On a motion to adjourn by Mr. Burleigh and a second by Mr. Dellafosse, the 

meeting adjourned at 6:16 p.m. 

                        

                        

___________________________                  ___________________________ 

Annette Ballard, President                                       Wayne Savoy, Secretary 
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